
Terms and Conditions 
   
Welcome to DR. WILLIAM MOUNT.com. Nothing on this website should be constructed as the giving of 
advice or the making of a recommendation is it for Pure Entertainment Purposes and it should not be relied 
on as the basis for any decision or action.   
  
The website has been developed as a service of DR. WILLIAM MOUNT.  Like any other service, in spite of 
our best efforts the information in this website may become out of date over time. 
  
Below are detailed Terms and Conditions you should read and understand as they govern your use of our 
website. 
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Acceptance of Terms and Conditions 
  
These Terms and Conditions, which include our Privacy Policy, govern your use of DR. WILLIAM MOUNT 
website, please read them carefully.  These Terms and Conditions define your rights and responsibilities 
as a user and/or visitor of this website operated by DR. WILLIAM MOUNT.  The website is operated in the 
United States of America.  Access is governed by these Terms and Conditions under the laws of the State 
of Washington and the United States.  The website and services provided herein are for adults.  When a 
minor uses the website, the parent or guardian of that minor will be held responsible for the minor’s actions.  
By using and/or visiting DR. WILLIAM MOUNT website, you except and agree to be bound by these Terms 
and Conditions.  If you do not agree with any of these Terms and Conditions, or if you have any objections 
to our Privacy Policy you must not use the DR. WILLIAM MOUNT website. 
  
Changes to Terms and Conditions 
  
DR. WILLIAM MOUNT reserves the right, from time to time, with or without notice to you, to change these 
Terms and Conditions, including the Privacy Policy, in its sole and absolute discretion.  The most current 
version of these Terms and Conditions can be viewed by visiting our website and clicking on “Terms and 
Conditions” located at the bottom of the pages of the DR. WILLIAM MOUNT website.  The most current 
version of the Terms and Conditions will supersede all previous versions.   
  
Disclaimers of Warranties and Limitations on Liability 
  



THIS SITE AND ALL INFORMATION, CONTENT, MATERIALS, PRODUCTS, SERVICES AND USER 
CONTENT INCLUDED ON OR OTHERWISE MADE AVAILABLE TO YOU THROUGH THE SITE 
(COLLECTIVELY, THE “SITE CONTENTS”) ARE PROVIDED BY DR. WILLIAM MOUNT ON AN “AS IS,” 
“AS AVAILABLE” BASIS, WITHOUT REPRESENTATIONS OR WARRANTIES OF ANY KIND. DR. 
WILLIAM MOUNT MAKES NO REPRESENTATIONS OR WARRANTIES OF ANY KIND, EXPRESSED 
OR IMPLIED, AS TO THE OPERATION OF THE SITE, THE ACCURACY OR COMPLETENESS OF THE 
SITE CONTENTS, OR THAT EMAILS SENT FROM DR. WILLIAM MOUNT ARE FREE OF MALWARE 
OR OTHER HARMFUL COMPONENTS.  WE DO NOT REPRESENT OR GUARANTEE THAT YOUR USE 
OF THE DR. WILLIAM MOUNT SITE WILL BE FREE FROM CORRUPTION, ATTACK, VIRUSES, 
INTERFERENCE; HACKING OR OTHER SECURITY INTRUSION AND WE DISCLAIM ANY LIABILITY 
WITH RESPECT THERETO.  NO ORAL OR WRITTEN INFORMATION OR ADVICE GIVEN BY US OR 
OUR AUTHORIZED REPRESENTATIVE SHALL CREATE A WARRANTY OR OTHERWISE 
CONSTITUTE A REPRESENTATION BINDING UPON DR. WILLIAM MOUNT.  YOU EXPRESSLY 
AGREE THAT YOUR USE OF THE SITE IS AT YOUR SOLE RISK.  YOU MAY NOT ASSIGN OR 
TRANSFER ANY OF YOUR RIGHTS OR OBLIGATIONS UNDER THESE TERMS AND CONDITION.  DR. 
WILLIAM MOUNT WILL NOT BE LIABLE FOR ANY DAMAGE OF ANY KIND ARISING FROM THE USE 
OF THE SITE OR THE SITE CONTENTS INCLUDING, WITHOUT LIMITATION, DIRECT, INDIRECT, 
CONSEQUENTIAL, PUNITIVE AND CONSEQUENTIAL DAMAGES.  TO THE FULL EXTENT 
PERMITTED BY LAW, DR. WILLIAM MOUNT DISCLAIMS ANY AND ALL REPRESENTATIONS AND 
WARRANTIES WITH RESPECT TO THE SITE AND THE SITE CONTENTS, WHETHER EXPRESSED 
OR IMPLIED, INCLUDING, WITHOUT LIMITATION, WARRANTIES OF MERCHANTABILITY, 
SATISFACTORY QUALITY AND FITNESS FOR A PARTICULAR PURPOSE OR USE.  UNDER NO 
CIRCUMSTANCES AND UNDER NO LEGAL OR EQUITABLE THEORY, WHETHER IN TORT, 
CONTRACT, STRICT LIABILITY OR OTHERWISE, SHALL DR. WILLIAM MOUNT OR ANY OF THEIR 
SHAREHOLDERS, DIRECTORS, OFFICERS, EMPLOYEES, AGENTS OR LICENSORS BE LIABLE 
(JOINTLY OR SEVERALLY) TO YOU FOR PERSONAL INJURY OR ANY SPECIAL, INCIDENTAL, 
INDIRECT OR CONSEQUENTIAL DAMAGES OF ANY KIND, OR ANY DAMAGES OR LOSS, 
WHATSOEVER RESULTING FROM LOSS OF USE, LOSS OF GOODWILL, WORK STOPPAGE, 
ACCURACY OF RESULTS, COMPUTER FAILURE OR MALFUNCTION, DATA OR PROFITS, BUSINESS 
INTERRUPTION OR ANY OTHER COMMERCIAL DAMAGES OR LOSS, WHETHER OR NOT ADVISED 
OF THE POSSIBILITY OF DAMAGE AND ON ANY THEORY OF LIABILITY, ARISING FROM THE USE 
OR INABILITY TO USE THE DR. WILLIAM MOUNT SERVICE, INCLUDING OUR WEBSITE. WE 
PROVIDE CONTENT ON THIS WEB SITE AS A SERVICE TO YOU, OUR CUSTOMER.  THE CONTENT 
IS NOT INTENDED TO DIAGNOSE, TREAT, CURE OR PREVENT ANY DISEASE.  NOTHING ON THIS 
WEB SITE SHOULD BE CONSTRUED AS THE GIVING OF ADVICE OR THE MAKING OF A 
RECOMMENDATION AND SHOULD NOT BE RELIED ON AS THE BASIS FOR ANY DECISION OR 
ACTION.  IT IS IMPORTANT THAT YOU RELY ONLY ON THE ADVICE OF A HEALTH CARE 
PROFESSIONAL TO ADVISE YOU ON YOUR SPECIFIC SITUATION. YOUR ACCESS TO OUR WEB 
SITE AND USE OF ITS CONTENTS, YOU AGREE THAT DR. WILLIAM MOUNT IS NOT LIABLE TO YOU 
IN ANY MANNER WHATSOEVER FOR DECISIONS YOU MAY MAKE OR YOUR ACTIONS OR 
NONACTIONS IN RELIANCE UPON THE CONTENT. YOU ALSO AGREE THAT THE AGGREGATE 
LIABILITY OF DR. WILLIAM MOUNT ARISING FROM OR RELATED TO YOUR USE AND ACCESS, 
REGARDLESS OF THE FORM OF ACTION OR CLAIM (FOR EXAMPLE, CONTRACT, WARRANTY, 
TORT, NEGLIGENCE, STRICT LIABILITY, PROFESSIONAL MALPRACTICE, FRAUD, INFRINGEMENT 
OR OTHER BASES FOR CLAIMS), IS LIMITED TO THE PURCHASE PRICE OF ANY ITEMS YOU 
PURCHASED FROM DR. WILLIAM MOUNT IN THE APPLICABLE TRANSACTION.  DR. WILLIAM 
MOUNT SHALL NOT IN ANY CASE BE LIABLE FOR ANY DIRECT, INDIRECT, SPECIAL, INCIDENTAL, 
CONSEQUENTIAL, OR PUNITIVE DAMAGES EVEN IF DR. WILLIAM MOUNT HAS BEEN ADVISED OF 
THE POSSIBILITY OF SUCH DAMAGES.  THIS IS A COMPREHENSIVE LIMITATION OF LIABILITY 
THAT APPLIES TO ALL LOSSES AND DAMAGES OF ANY KIND.  IF YOU ARE DISSATISFIED WITH 
OUR WEB SITE OR ITS CONTENT (INCLUDING TERMS AND CONDITIONS), YOUR SOLE AND 
EXCLUSIVE REMEDY IS TO DISCONTINUE USING OUR WEB SITE.  ON THE SITE, WE MAY DISPLAY 
NAMES, MARKS, PRODUCTS, ADVERTISEMENTS, OR SERVICES OF THIRD PARTIES, POP-UPS, 
OR LINKS TO THIRD PARTY SITES.  IN NO EVENT WILL WE BE LIABLE, DIRECTLY OR INDIRECTLY, 
TO ANYONE FOR ANY DAMAGE OR LOSS ARISING FROM OR RELATING TO ANY USE, CONTINUED 
USE, OR RELIANCE ON ANY ADVERTISEMENT DISPLAYED ON THE SITE, ANY PRODUCTS, 



SERVICES, OR OTHER MATERIALS RELATING TO ANY SUCH ADVERTISEMENT, ANY LINKED 
THIRD PARTY SITE, OR LINK CONTAINED IN A LINKED SITE.  IF YOU DECIDE TO LINK TO ANY 
SUCH THIRD PARTY SITES, YOU DO SO ENTIRELY AT YOUR OWN RISK. IF ANY APPLICABLE 
AUTHORITY HOLDS ANY PORTION OF THIS SECTION OR OTHER SECTIONS OF THESE TERMS 
AND CONDITIONS, INCLUDING ANY PORTION OF THE PRIVACY POLICY TO BE INVALID, ILLEGAL 
OR UNENFORCEABLE, THEN SUCH PART SHALL BE ELIMINATED OR LIMITED TO THE MINIMUM 
EXTENT NECESSARY.  THE REMAINDER OF THE TERMS AND CONDITIONS AND PRIVACY POLICY, 
INCLUDING ANY REVISED PORTION, SHALL REMAIN AND BE IN FULL FORCE AND EFFECT.  THE 
FAILURE OF DR. WILLIAM MOUNT TO EXERCISE OR ENFORCE ANY TERM WILL NOT CONSTITUTE 
A WAIVER OF SUCH TERM REGARDLESS OF ANY STATUTE OR LAW TO THE CONTRARY. 
  
Indemnification 
  
You agree to indemnify, defend and hold harmless DR. WILLIAM MOUNT or any of their shareholders, 
directors, officers, employees, agents, venders, suppliers, service providers (jointly or severally) from and 
against any liabilities, losses, investigations, inquires, claims, suits, damages, costs and expenses 
(including, without limitation, reasonable attorneys’ fees and expenses) (each, a “Claim”) arising out of or 
otherwise relating to your use of the site, including without limitation any user content submitted by you and 
claims alleging facts that if true would constitute a breach by you of these Terms and Conditions. 
  
Copyright and Intellectual Property 
  
All content included in or made available through this site including but not limited to, text, images, 
illustrations, designs, photographs, graphics, logos, page headers, buttons, icons, images, audio clips, 
digital downloads programs, data compilations and other material that are part of this site (collectively, the 
“Content”) is the property of DR. WILLIAM MOUNT or its content suppliers and protected by the United 
States and International Copyright laws.  The compilation (meaning the collection, arrangement and 
assembly) of all content on this site is the exclusive property of DR. WILLIAM MOUNT and is also protected 
by United States and International copyright laws.  DR. WILLIAM MOUNT hereby authorizes you to copy 
material and print hard copy portions of this site for the sole purpose of placing an order with DR. WILLIAM 
MOUNT, purchasing DR. WILLIAM MOUNT products and is for non-commercial use only, provided any 
copy of these materials which you make shall retain all copyright and other proprietary notices and any 
disclaimers contained thereon and on this web site.  Any other use, including but not limited to the 
reproduction, distribution, display or transmission of the content of this site is strictly prohibited, unless 
authorized by DR. WILLIAM MOUNT.  You further agree not to change or delete any proprietary notices 
from materials downloaded from the site.  Nothing contained herein shall be construed as conferring by 
implication, estoppel or otherwise any license or right under any patent or trade of DR. WILLIAM MOUNT 
or any third party.  Except as expressly provided, nothing contained herein shall be construed as conferring 
any license or right under any DR. WILLIAM MOUNT copyright.  Should any viewer of DR. WILLIAM 
MOUNT published document respond with information including feedback data such as questions, 
comments, suggestions, or the like regarding the content of any such DR. WILLIAM MOUNT material, such 
information shall be deemed to be non-confidential and DR. WILLIAM MOUNT shall have no obligation of 
any kind with respect to such information and shall by free to reproduce, use, disclose and distribute the 
information to others without limitation.  DR. WILLIAM MOUNT shall by free to use any idea, concepts, 
know-how or techniques contained in such information for any purpose whatsoever including but not limited 
to developing, manufacturing and marketing products incorporating such information. 
  
Trademarks 
  
In addition, service names, DR. WILLIAM MOUNT.com, graphics, logos, page headers button icons, scripts 
and service marks included in or made available through any DR. WILLIAM MOUNT service are trademarks 
or trade dress of DR. WILLIAM MOUNT in the United States and Internationally.  DR. WILLIAM MOUNT 
trademarks and trade dress may not be used in connection with any product or service that is not DR. 
WILLIAM MOUNT’S, in any manner that is likely to cause confusion among customers or in any manner 
that disparages or discredits DR. WILLIAM MOUNT.  All trademarks not owned by DR. WILLIAM MOUNT 



that appear in any DR. WILLIAM MOUNT service are the property of their respective owners, who may or 
may not be affiliated with, connected to, or sponsored by DR. WILLIAM MOUNT. 
  
Links to Third Party Web Site 
 
The site may contain links and interactive functionality interacting with the web sites of third parties including 
but not limited to social sites and service providers’ sites.  DR. WILLIAM MOUNT is not responsible for and 
has no liability for the functionality, actions, inactions, privacy policies, terms, or contents of any such web 
site. Before enabling any sharing functions of the site to communicate with any such web site or otherwise 
visiting any such, DR. WILLIAM MOUNT strongly recommends that you review and understand the Terms 
and Conditions, Privacy Policies, settings and information-sharing functions of each such third-party web 
site.  The links and interactive functionality for third party sites on the site do not constitute and endorsement 
by DR. WILLIAM MOUNT of such third-party sites.  Other sites may link to the site with or without our 
authorization and we may block any links to or from the site.  YOUR USE OF THIRD PARTY WEB SITES 
AND RESOURCES IS AT YOUR OWN RISK. 
  
Use and Access 
  
DR. WILLIAM MOUNT or its content providers grant you limited non-exclusive, non-transferable, non-sub 
use to access and make personal and non-commercial use of the DR. WILLIAM MOUNT services.  This 
use and access do not include any resale or commercial use of any DR. WILLIAM MOUNT service, or its 
contents; any collection and use of any product listing, descriptions, or prices; any derivative use of any 
DR. WILLIAM MOUNT services or its contents; any downloading or copying of account information for 
benefit of another merchant; or any use of data mining, robots, or similar data gathering and extraction 
tools.  All rights not expressly granted to you in these Terms and Conditions are reserved and retained by 
DR. WILLIAM MOUNT or its licensors, suppliers, publishers, right holders, or other content providers.  No 
DR. WILLIAM MOUNT service, nor any part of any DR. WILLIAM MOUNT service, may be reproduced, 
duplicated, copied, sold, resold, visited, or otherwise exploited for any commercial purpose without express 
written consent of DR. WILLIAM MOUNT.  You may not frame or utilize framing techniques to enclose any 
trademark, logo, or other proprietary information (including images, text, page layout, or form) of DR. 
WILLIAM MOUNT without express written consent.  You may not use any meta tags or any other “hidden 
text” utilizing DR. WILLIAM MOUNT’S name, copyrights or trademarks without the express written consent 
of DR. WILLIAM MOUNT.  You may not misuse the DR. WILLIAM MOUNT service.  You may use the DR. 
WILLIAM MOUNT service only as permitted by law.   
  
Information Submitted 
  
DR. WILLIAM MOUNT is free to use any comments, information, ideas, concepts, reviews, testimonies or 
techniques or any material contained in any communication you may send to us (“Feedback”), including 
responses to questionnaires, testimonies submissions or through postings to the DR. WILLIAM MOUNT 
service, including the DR. WILLIAM MOUNT website and user interfaces, without compensation, 
acknowledgement or payment to you for any purpose whatsoever including, but not limited to, developing, 
manufacturing and marketing products and creating, modifying or improving the DR. WILLIAM MOUNT 
service.  Furthermore, by posting any Feedback on our site, submitting Feedback to us, testimonies 
submissions or in responding to questionnaires, you grant us a perpetual, worldwide, non-exclusive, royalty-
free, irrevocable license, transferable right and license to use, perform, transmit, copy, modify, delete, 
adapt, publish, translate, create derivative works from, sell, distribute including the right to sublicense such 
right, right to display, use, reproduce or modify the Feedback submitted in any form, media, software or 
technology of any kind now existing or developed in the future throughout the world, all without any 
compensation to you.  For this reason, do not send us any Feedback that you do not wish to license to us, 
including but not limited to any confidential information or any original creative materials such as 
testimonies, stories, product ideas, computer code or original artwork.  In addition, you grant to DR. 
WILLIAM MOUNT the right to include the name provided along with the user content submitted by you; 
provided, however, DR. WILLIAM MOUNT shall have no obligation to include such name with such user 
content.  DR. WILLIAM MOUNT is not responsible for the use or disclosure of any personal information that 
you disclose in connection with any user content you submit.  You further irrevocably waive any “moral 



rights” or other rights with respect to attribution of authorship or integrity of materials regarding user content 
that you may have under any applicable law under legal theory.  Content is also provided by third parties.  
Please note that third parties may post content that is inaccurate, misleading, or deceptive.  DR. WILLIAM 
MOUNT neither endorses nor is responsible for any opinion, advise, information, or statements made by 
third parties. DR. WILLIAM MOUNT will not be liable for any loss or damage caused by your reliance on 
such information or materials.  The opinions expressed by third parties reflect solely the opinions of the 
individuals who submitted such opinions and may not reflect the opinions of DR. WILLIAM MOUNT.  Please 
note DR. WILLIAM MOUNT does not accept unsolicited materials or ideas for use or publication and is not 
responsible for the similarity of any of its content in any media to materials or ideas transmitted to DR. 
WILLIAM MOUNT.  Should you send any unsolicited materials or ideas, you do so with the understanding 
that no consideration of any sort will be provided to you and you are waiving any claim against DR. WILLIAM 
MOUNT and its affiliates regarding the use of such materials and ideas, even if material or idea is used that 
is substantially similar to the idea you sent. 
  
Your conduct in accessing the DR. WILLIAM MOUNT service 
  
By accessing the DR. WILLIAM MOUNT service including DR. WILLIAM MOUNT web site and user 
interfaces, you agree to use the DR. WILLIAM MOUNT service, including all features and functionalities 
associated therewith, the web site and user interfaces and all content associated therewith in accordance 
with all applicable laws, rules and regulations, including public performance limitations or other restrictions 
on use of the service or content therein.  Users are prohibited from violating or attempting to violate the 
security of DR. WILLIAM MOUNT services, including, without limitation, (a) accessing data not intended for 
such user or logging onto a server or account which the user is not authorized to access; (b) attempting to 
probe, scan or test the vulnerability of a system or Network or breach security or authentication measures 
without proper authorization; (c) attempting to interface with service to any user, host or Network, including, 
without limitation, via means of submitting a virus to the site, overloading, “flooding,” “spamming,” 
“mailbombing” or “crashing,” (d) sending unsolicited email, including promotions and/or advertising of 
products or services; or (e) forging any TCP/IP packet header or any part of the header information in any 
email or newsgroup posting.  Violations of system or network security may result in civil or criminal liability.  
DR. WILLIAM MOUNT will investigate occurrences that may involve such violations and may involve, 
cooperate with law enforcement authorities in prosecuting users who are involved in such violations.  You 
agree not to use any device, software or routine to interfere or attempt to interfere with the proper working 
of this site or any activity being conducted on the site.  You agree, further, not to use or attempt to use any 
engine, software, tool, agent or other device or mechanism (including without limitation browsers, spiders, 
robots, avatars or intelligent agents) to navigate or search this site other than the search engine and search 
agents available to DR. WILLIAM MOUNT on this site and other generally available third-party web 
browsers (i.e., Microsoft Edge, Google Chrome). You also agree not to impersonate any other person while 
using the DR. WILLIAM MOUNT services, conduct yourself in a vulgar or offensive manner while using the 
DR. WILLIAM MOUNT service, or use the DR. WILLIAM MOUNT for any unlawful purpose.  You agree that 
all of the foregoing restrictions apply not only to the DR. WILLIAM MOUNT service, but also to the servers 
and networks connected to any portions of the DR. WILLIAM MOUNT service whether operated by DR. 
WILLIAM MOUNT or third parties (“Networks”).  You agree not to interfere with Networks, violate any of the 
procedures, policies or regulations applicable to Networks, use Networks in a way that harms or impairs 
anyone else’s use of Networks, use Networks to gain unauthorized access to any service, data, account or 
other Networks, use Networks to falsify any protocol or email header information (e.g. “spoofing”), use 
Networks to send “spam” (i.e. unsolicited bulk email or commercial messages) or items of a destructive or 
deceptive nature, or remove, modify, or tamper with any regulatory or legal notice or link that is incorporated 
into Networks. 
  
Privacy and Communications Preferences 
  
Any personally identifying information submitted through DR. WILLIAM MOUNT service is subject to DR. 
WILLIAM MOUNT Privacy Policy, the terms of which are incorporated herein.  Please review DR. WILLIAM 
MOUNT Privacy Policy to understand our practices.  By using DR. WILLIAM MOUNT services, you are 
consenting to receive certain communications from us.  We may use this information to process orders, 
respond to your requests, improve our level of service and the content of our site; provide you with product 



news and updates; notify you of new DR. WILLIAM MOUNT products; seek your views on our products and 
for our own administrative and quality assurance purposes.  By using the DR. WILLIAM MOUNT service, 
you consent to receiving electronic communications from DR. WILLIAM MOUNT and/or our service 
providers.  Please be aware that we may still contact you for transactional purposes. Some examples are 
contacts for customer service, product information, order information, mailing information, reminder notices.  
We may also need to contact you with questions or information regarding your order, such as order status, 
mailing and other order information.  You agree that all agreements, notices, disclosures and other 
communications that DR. WILLIAM MOUNT provides to you electronically satisfy any legal requirement 
that such communications be in writing. 
  
Privacy Policy 
  
Please review DR. WILLIAM MOUNT Privacy Policy, which also governs your use of DR. WILLIAM MOUNT 
services, to understand our practices. 
  
Colors 
  
DR. WILLIAM MOUNT strives to display as accurately as possible the colors of the products shown on the 
site; however, DR. WILLIAM MOUNT cannot and does not guarantee that your monitor’s display of any 
color will be accurate. 
  
Availability, Errors and Inaccuracies 
  
DR. WILLIAM MOUNT cannot and do not guarantee the accuracy or completeness of any information, 
including content and services.  DR. WILLIAM MOUNT reserves the right to change or update information 
and to correct errors, inaccuracies or omissions at any time without prior notice.   
  
Jurisdictional Issues 
  
The site is controlled and operated by DR. WILLIAM MOUNT from Tacoma, Washington in the United 
States and is not intended to subject DR. WILLIAM MOUNT to the laws or jurisdiction of any other state, 
country, territory other than that of Tacoma, Washington in the United States.  DR. WILLIAM MOUNT does 
not represent or warrant that the site or any part thereof is appropriate or available for use in any particular 
jurisdiction other than Tacoma, Washington in the United States.    In choosing to access the site, you do 
so on your own initiative and at your own risk and you are responsible for complying with all local laws, 
rules and regulations.  DR. WILLIAM MOUNT may limit the site’s availability, in whole or in part, to any 
person, geographic area or jurisdiction DR. WILLIAM MOUNT choose, at any time and in its sole discretion. 
  
Governing Law 
  
These Terms and Conditions and Privacy Policy shall be governed by and construed in accordance with 
the laws of the State of Washington in the United States, without regards to conflict of law provisions.  If 
any provisions or provisions of these Terms and Conditions and Privacy Policy shall be held to be invalid, 
illegal or unenforceable, then such part shall be eliminated or limited to the minimum extent necessary.  
The remainder of the Terms and Conditions and Privacy Policy, including any revised portion, shall remain 
and be in full force and effect.   
  
Applicable Law; Disputes 
  
You agree that all matters relating to your access to or use of the site and all matters arising out of or related 
to these Terms and Conditions, including all disputes, will be governed by the laws of the State of 
Washington, United States, without regard to Washington’s choice of law principles.  You furthermore agree 
that the exclusive forum and venue for any legal action arising out of or related to these Terms and 
Conditions shall be the United States district court of the district of Tacoma, Washington and you submit to 
the personal jurisdiction of that court.  If subject matter jurisdiction (including diversity jurisdiction) does not 
exist in the United States district court for the district of Tacoma, Washington, then the exclusive forum and 



venue for any such action shall be the courts of the State of Washington located in Peirce County and you 
submit to the personal jurisdiction of that court. The making of claims or resolution of disputes pursuant to 
these Terms and Conditions shall be in your individual capacity and not as plaintiff or class member in any 
purposed class or representative proceeding.  You agree that to the extent permitted by applicable law: (1) 
any and all disputes, claims and causes of action arising out of or connected with the site and/or these 
Terms and Conditions will be resolved individually in the forum designated in this section, without resort to 
any form or class action; and (2) any and all claims, judgments and awards will be limited to actual third-
party, out-of-pocket costs incurred (if any), but in no event will attorneys’ fees be awarded or recoverable. 
  
Termination 
  
DR. WILLIAM MOUNT reserves the right, without notice and in its sole discretion, to terminate your use of 
the site and block or prevent future access to and use of the site (i) if you violate any of these Term and 
Conditions, (ii) for any reason, or (iii) for no reason.  Upon any such termination, your right to use the site 
will immediately cease. 
  
Miscellaneous 
  
You acknowledge and agree that DR. WILLIAM MOUNT may disclose information if DR. WILLIAM MOUNT 
believes that it is required to do so by law, or that such preservation or disclosure is reasonably necessary 
to (a) comply with legal process or governmental requests; (b) respond to claims that any content violates 
the rights of third parties; or (c) protect the rights, property, or safety of the web site, the users or the public.  
You agree to indemnify DR. WILLIAM MOUNT against all liabilities, claims and expenses that may arise 
from any breach of these Terms and Conditions by you or otherwise as a result of your use of the DR. 
WILLIAM MOUNT services or web site. These Terms and Conditions, including policies and information 
linked from or incorporated herein, constitute the entire agreement between you and DR. WILLIAM MOUNT 
with respect to the site and supersede all prior or contemporaneous communications, agreements and 
proposals with respect to the site. DR. WILLIAM MOUNT reserves the right to waive any provisions of these 
terms and Conditions. No failure to exercise, partial exercise of, or delay in exercising any right or remedy 
under these Terms and Conditions shall operate as a waiver or estoppel of any right, remedy, or condition.  
If any provision of these Terms and Conditions is held invalid, illegal or unenforceable, the validity, legality 
and enforceability of the remaining provisions will not be affected or impaired.  You may not assign, transfer 
or sublicense any of your rights or obligations under these Terms and Conditions without DR. WILLIAM 
MOUNT express prior written consent.  We will not be responsible for failure to fulfill any obligation due to 
causes beyond our control. 
  
Contact  
  
DR. WILLIAM MOUNT 
Email Drwilliammount@gmail.com 


